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9/17/2004 
Marion County BOCC 
Attn: Karen Holgate 

karen.nolgate@mariooll.org 

352-671-8570 

Garber Chevrolet 
Dan Drake 

Mari.on 

/904) 264-2442 ext.2332 FAX: (904/ 284-0054 

3340 Hwy 17 Green Cove Spn'ngs, FL 32043 

ddrake@garoerautomall.cgm 

BOCC 

Prices are published by tht! l'lorlda Sheriffs Am.>dlltlon (www.flsherffls.org) 
Purchasing contract number Is FSAZII-VEUZ.O Pursuit Administrative & Other Vehicles, 
eKf)iring september 30th, 2025. If you have any questions regardlnjJ this quote please 

call! 

Work Truck Preferred Equipment Group Includes standard equipment 
Engine, TurboMax Included 
Transmission, 8-speed automatic Included 
Exterior Paint Color: Summit White Included 
Seats, front 40/20/40 split-bench Included 
Jet Blacl<, Vinyl seat trim Included 
Audio system, Chevrolet Infotainment 3 system Included 
Traitefing Package 425.00 (8.50) 

NON OEM OPTIOIIIS: Hours: 
Dealer Tint All Wlndows 20% Match Includes Windshield Strip 320.00 $320.00 
Third Key Cut and Programmed Includes Key Fob 265.00 $265.00 
Westin Oval Nerf Steps 509.00 $509.00 
Professional Spray In Bed Liner llnex 575.00 $575.00 
4 Corner Super LED Strobe Kit (Amber) 545.00 1.00 $895.00 
Tri Fold Hard Cover Tonneau Cover 1,604.00 $1,604.00 
750-800 Watt Inverter 99.00 1.00 $99.00 
2.0 Hr EVT Certified Installation @ ($125/HR) 250.00 $250.00 
Delivery Included $0.00 
Temporary Tag 6.00 $6.00 

9119120244:26 PM Manoo County 2025 Chevrolet Sllverado 4wd CK10753 Double Cab 147 qty 5 Quote 9 19 24 



Holgate, Karen 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

I approve of the quote. 

Thanks, 

Director/Building Official 
Building Safety 

Savage, Michael 
Thursday, September 19, 2024 7:53 PM 
Holgate, Karen; Cruz, Nikita 
Williams, Mark; Brown, Chuck 
RE: QUOTE- Vehicles - FY25 

Main: 352-438-2400 I Direct: 352-438-2459 

From: Holgate, Karen <Karen.Holgate@marionfl.org> 
Sent: Thursday, September 19, 2024 4:30 PM 
To: Savage, Michael <Michael.Savage@marionfl.org>; Cruz, Nikita <Nikita.Cruz@marionfl.org> 
Cc: Williams, Mark <Mark.Williams@marionfl.org> 
Subject: QUOTE- Vehicles - FY25 

Good Afternoon, 

Please see the attached quote for your review and approval. Let me know if I can proceed with the PO request. 

Thank you. 

Administrative Manager 
Fleet Management 
Main: 352-671-8570 I Direct: 352-671- 8572 
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