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Call Us first, for all of your Fleet Automotive, & Light Truck needs. Quote
PHONE (800) ALANJAY (252-6529) DIRECT 8634024234 WWW.ALANJAY.COM 57911-6
2003 U.S. 27 South MOBILE 863-273-1105 ' g | P.0. BOX 8200
%! Sebring, FL 33870 FAX 8634024221 | Sebring, FL 33871-9200

ORJGINALS%C;:ADATE QUICK QUOTE SHEET REVISE‘II‘)”?;‘?;E DATE

REQUESTING AGENCY MARION COUNTY BOCC

CONTACT PERSON KAREN HOLGATE-RESTO EMAIL  KarenHolgate@marioncountyfl.ora

PHONE 352-671-8572 MOBILE FAX 352-671-8586
|SOURCEWELL CONTRACT # 2025 091521-NAF & 032824-NAF www.NationalAutoFleetGroup.com
MODEL U4X 301A MSRP $63,775.00

20250 FORD TRANSIT T-350HD EXTENDED LENGTH WAGON HIGH
ROOF RWD DRW 148" WB XL - (15-PASS BASE)

CUSTOMER ID NJPA PRICE $57.651.00
*~ All vehicles will be ordered white w/ darkest interior unless clearly stated otherwise on purchase order.
FACTORY OPTIONS DESCRIPTION
A74 Oxford White $0.00

CONTRACT OPTIONS $0.00
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( SOURCEWELL CONTRACT # 2025 091521-NAF & 032824-NAF www.NationalAutoFleetGroup.com

TRADE IN TOTAL COST . $63,066.00

TOTAL COST LESS TRADE IN(S) Qry 1 $63,066.00

i Estimated Annual payments for 60 months paid in advance: $14,500.18 ‘
b ... Municipal finance for any essential use vehicle, requires lender approval,k WAC.

Comments QUOTE SUBJECT TO FACTORY ORDER ACCEPTANCE or 30 DAYS

VEHICLE QUOTED BY ASHLEE WILSON GOVERNMENT ACCOUNT MANAGER Ashlge.Wilson@AlanJay.com

"I Want to be Your Fleet Provider”
{ appreciate the opportunily to submit this quotation. Please review it carefully. If there are any errors or changes, please feel free to contact me at any time.
| am always happy to be of assistance.
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Hoigate, Karen

From: Majoros, Jessica

Sent: Tuesday, October 8, 2024 9:37 AM
To: Holgate, Karen; Ryan, Charles
Subject: RE: QUOTE- Parks Department - FY25

Woohoo ~ Yes please! | will print and sign. Thank you!

lessica Majoros, CPRP
Recreation Manager

Parks & Recreation
Main: 352-671-8560 | Direct: 352-671-8554

Empowering Marion for Syccess?

From: Holgate, Karen <Karen.Holgate@marionfi.org>

Sent: Monday, October 7, 2024 1:.51 PM

To: Majoros, lessica <Jessica.Majoros@marionfl.org>; Ryan, Charles <Charles.Ryan@marionfl.org>
Subject: RE: QUOTE- Parks Department - FY25

Option: 61D was added at no costs.

Thanks.

Karen Holgate
Administrative Manager

Fleet Management
Main: 352-671-8570 | Direct: 352-671- 8572

From: Majoros, Jessica <jessica Maloros@marionflore>

Sent: Monday, October 7, 2024 9:45 AM

To: Holgate, Karen <Karen Holgate @marionflorg>; Ryan, Charles <Charles Rvan@marionflorg>
Subject: RE: QUOTE- Parks Department - FY25

Wow! it is under budget! Thank you, with it coming in under, can we afford the option for the surround cameras? Is it
available on the XL models? If not, this is perfect.



