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Call Us first, for all of your Fleet Automotive, & Light Truck needs. . Quote
PHONE (800) ALANJAY (252-6529) DIRECT 863-402-4234 WWW.ALANJAY.COM  §0987-1
_Corporate 2003 U.S. 27 South MOBILE 863-273-1105 ~ Mailing | P.O. BOX 9200
Office | sobring, FL 33870 FAX 863-402-4221 {  Address|gopring, FL 338719200

ORIGINAL QUOTE DATE REVISED QUOTE DATE
11242025 QUICK QUOTE SHEET 2aiz00s

REQUESTING AGENCY MARION COUNTY BOCC

CONTACT PERSON KAREN HOLGATE-RESTO EMAIL  Karen Holgate@marioncountvil.org

PHONE 352.671-8572 MOBILE FAX 352-671-8586 B

SOURCEWELL CONTRACT # 2024 091521-NAF & 060920-NAF www.NationalAutoFleetGroup.com

MODEL CK20743 1WT MSRP $55,305.00 o
2025 CHEVY SILVERADO 2500HD CREW CAB PICKUP 4WD WT 6.5 BED N

CUSTOMER D CONTRACT PRICE $48,655.00

_ BEDLENGTH 6.5 Bed |

** All vehicles w:ll be ordered white w/ darkest interior unless clearly stated otherwise on purchase order.

FACTORY OPTIONS DESCRIPTION

GAZ _ Summit White 7 $0.00
S JetBlack, Vinylseattrim .. 800
T Engine,66LV8 - 50,00
MKM MTransmlssmn Aihson 10 Speed automatic 777777777777777777 $OOO
"”17\/;/} o _ 777777777 “OAPT'ONSWOFkTFUCk Preferred Eqmpmentéroup ””v”"'”"'"”7"’”””’”””"‘ ”7””””” HHW” 7”::”7 o 7”’”“””’5’6:66“
A0 Gesdeeptited e 3000
A Seats, front 40/20/a0splitbench . 8000
oS Defoggerrearwindowelectic . 80
' DEG e Mirrors, outside power-adjustable vertical trailering - %000
ke Emissions, Federal requirements $0.00

64 ’ Rearaxle,373ratio $0.00
I Audio system, Chevrolet Infotainment3system 4
e _ GVWR, 10,450 Ibs. (4740 kg) - - %000
L WT ConveniencePackage e ST8000,
@ Wheels, 17" (432 cm) machined aluminum $345.00
oo Tires, LT245/75R17E all-season, blackwall ¢
Qs Taigate, gate function manual with EZLift R 8000
vao LPO,Blackworkstep ’ - '  $570.00
ma Tire,spare LT245/7SR17E allseason, blackwall . $000

FACTORY OPTIONS $1,695.00

CONTRACT OPTIONS DESCRIPTION

NO-TEMP TEMP TAG N_OT REQUESTED, CUSTOMER WILL HANDLE THEIR OWN TAG WORK . S0. OO;
E Additional key and remote, cut and programmed. "‘WW":"_',‘__";:,"_” 77777777777 T anw
TKLEERlOORSB LeerlOORtOpperwnhfrar}\edwmdoérsandframed reardoorforshortbed plckups $444000;

CONTRACT OPTIONS $4,715.00
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SOURCEWELL CONTRACT # 2024 091521-NAF & 060920-NAF www.NationalAutoFleetGroup-comJ

TRADE N TOTAL COST $55,065.00

TOTAL COST LESS TRADE IN{S)  QTY 1 ‘ $55 065 00

Estimated Amua’évpayments for 60 months paid in advance: $12,660.58
Municipal finance for any essential use vehicle, requires lender approval, WAL,

Comments QUOTE SUBJECT TO FACTORY ORDER ACCEPTANCE or 30 DAYS

VEHICLE QUOTED BY ASHLEE WILSON GOVERNMENT ACCOUNT MANAGER Ashiee Wilson@AlanJay.com

"I Want to be Your Fleet Provider”
| appreciate the opportunity to submit this quotation. Please review it carefully. If there are any errors or changes, please feel free to contact me at any time,
1 am always happy to be of assistance.
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Fw: Letter of Intent approval for 2025 Chevy Silverado 2500 Crew Cab
From Williams, Mark <Mark Williams@marionfl.org>

Date Fri 5/9/2025 2:19 PM

To Holgate, Karen <Karen.Holgate@marionfl.org>

Mark Williams

Fleet Management Director

Fleet Management

Main: 352-671-8570 | Direct: 352-671-8571
Empowering Marion for Success!

From: Bouyounes, Mounir <Mounir.Bouyounes@marionfl.org>

Sent: Friday, May 9, 2025 2:18 PM

To: Chinevere, Shari <Shari.Chinevere@marionfl.org>

Cc: Cahill, Lisa <Lisa.Cahill@marionfl.org>; Williams, Mark <Mark.Williams@marionfl.org>
Subject: RE: Letter of Intent approval for 2025 Chevy Silverado 2500 Crew Cab

Approved.

Mounir Bouyounes, P.E.

County Administrator
Administration

Main: 352-438-2300 | Direct: 352-438-2312
Empowering Marion for Success!

From: Chinevere, Shari <Shari.Chinevere@marionfl.org>

Sent: Friday, May 9, 2025 11:49 AM

To: Bouyounes, Mounir <Mounir.Bouyounes@marionfl.org>

Cc: Cahill, Lisa <Lisa.Cahill@marionfl.org>; Williams, Mark <Mark.Williams@marionfl.org>
Subject: Letter of Intent approval for 2025 Chevy Silverado 2500 Crew Cab

Mounir,

Lisa spoke to you on Wednesday about a vehicle purchase and asked me to send
this e-mail to you with the attached quote and funds available for approval.

Fleet followed up with Alan Jay Fleet Sales regarding the 2025 Chevy Silverado
2500 Crew Cab that PSC received a quote for back in January. They've confirmed
Alan Jay will honor the original quoted price of $55,065, provided we place the
order within the next two weeks.



Unfortunately, this doesn’t allow enough time to go to the Board for approval
beforehand. To move forward within the required timeframe, Fleet will need to send
a letter of intent to the dealer so the order can be placed before the order window
closes for the 2025 model. The purchase will then be presented to the Board for
approval at their next scheduled meeting.

Please let me know if you're comfortable with us proceeding this way.

Thank You,

Shari Chinevere

Administrative Manager

Public Safety Communications

Main: 352-732-9111 | Direct: 352-438-2858
Empowering Marion for Success!






