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FLORIDA SHERIFF'S ASSOCIATION Contract - BID FSA23-VEH21

Customer:  Marion County
Date of Quote: 9/27/2024

Specification: 60 Region: Central Qty  Unit Cost

Base Price: 2026 INTERNATIONAL HX 1 $129,913.50
Contract Options:
1AMS Heavy rear crossmember 1 $ 181.00
1GTA Tow pin reinforcemant 1 8 123.00
1GBP Frame reinforcement . 1 $ 18624.00
1vBC Heavy front tow pin 1 $ 587.00
1WXM Wheel base range 1 3 978.00
2ARY 20,000 front axie 1§ 171500
3AGA 20,000 front suspension 1% 507.00
4619 Trailer connections 1 8 379.00
4722 DV 2 drain valve 1 8 100.00
4WZJ Air tank location 1 $ 352.00
5PTB Dual steering gears 1 8 811.00
7BES After treatment cover 1 8 349.00
8HAE Body builder wiring 1 8 254.00
8RPS Bluetooth radio t % 338.00
8TMG Trailer socket 1 % 140.00
9HCN Chrome Grill 1§ 230.00
12EWW Cummins X15 450 HP engine 1 8 408.00
13BEK Allison 4000 RDS transmission 1 $ 18,724.00
13WCU Qil cooler 1 8 960.00
13WVV Neutral at stop 1§ 508.00
14HRM 46,000 rear axle with driver controlled diff locks 1 $ 393100
14UZB 46,000 rear suspension 1 $ 200900
14WBV Rear shocks 1 8 615.00
16SNR Power mirrors 1§ 467.00
27DUM 22 5x 12.25 front wheels 1 $ 735.00
Safety Safety kit 1 8 300.00
Strobes 4 corner strobe lights 1§ 150000
Rotobec Rotobec loader and 24' dump body 1 $154,000.00
Pintle Pintle hook 1 % 195000

NON Contract Options

Mods Relocate battery box and air dryer 1§ 280000
10VAA Total 3 Keys 1 9 40.00

Tint Window Tint 1 3% 150.00



9/2712024

Total:

Total Purchase Order Amount:

Cab Color:
Bady Color:

Prepared By:
Sally Wilson

Cumberland International Trucks LLC

Muvocalecusllonvnl

WHITE

**included in base price

BLACK

2110 S Division AVE Orlando FL 32805

Office - 407.295.9777 / fax - 407.295.9727 / Email - swilson@cltte.com

$ 327,678.50
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Extended
$ 129,913.50

:3 181.00
$ 123.00
$ 1,624.00
$ 587.00
$ 978.00
$ 1,715.00
$ 507.00
$ 379.00
$ 100.00
$ 352.00
$ 811.00
$  349.00
3 254.00
$ 338.00
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2,800.00
40.00
150.00
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$ 327,678.50



Holgate. Karen

From: Peltz, Jared

Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 9:06 AM
To: Holgate, Karen

Ce: Williams, Marl; Cohoon, Steven
Subject: RE: QUOTE- Grapple Tk-FY25

Sounds great. Lets do it.

Jared Peltz
Assistant County Engineer for Road Maintenance

Office of the County Engineer
Main: 352-671-8686 | Direct: 352-671-8339
Empowering Marion for Success!

From: Holgate, Karen <Karen.Holgate@marionfl.org>

Sent: Wednesday, Octeber 23, 2024 8:58 AM

To: Peltz, Jared <lared.Peltz@marionfl.org>

Cc: Williams, Mark <Mark.Williams@marionfl.org>; Cohoon, Steven <Steven.Cohoon@marionfl.org>

Subject: RE: QUOTE- Grapple Tk-FY25
Good Morning lared,

Please see the response to your concern below.
Thanks.

Good Morning Karen,
| spoke w/ Randy at Quality (Body Company for Rotobec Grapples) and this was his response:

Sally,

Yes, these booms and bodies will be identical to the last ones we built. There is one nice upgrade to the grapple
(clamshell attachment). Rotobec has a newer and improved version of the 045W waste grapple, and it is now called the
110WG. It looks like the County’s existing 045W grapples, but they improved the cylinders and hydraulic hose routing
which is a good thing.

Randy



